
Amended BYLAWS of the Jerome Country Club 

(As Adopted by the Board of Directors and Members) 

DECEMBER 5, 2018 

ARTICLE I 

TERMS NAMES PURPOSES9 OFFICES 

Section 1. Terms. The following definitions shall be used to interpret these Bylaws 
      unless the context otherwise requires. 

(a) “Club" means the Jerome Country Club, Inc., an Idaho non-profit corporation. The 
terms "club" and "corporation" will be used in these bylaws to mean the same entity. 

(b) “Board" means the Board of Directors of the Club. 

( c) “His" or "Her" shall refer to any regular member referenced in the particular bylaw 
provision, without regard to whether such regular member is male or female. 

Section 2. Purpose  The purposes for which the Club is organized are: 

(a) To transact any and all lawful business authorized by the Idaho Nonprofit 
Corporation Act and to exercise all the rights and powers conferred on nonprofit 
corporations under the laws of Idaho. 

(b) To Provide and operate facilities including, but not limited to, golf courses, 
clubhouses, and other recreational, sport, and social facilities for the entertainment and 
enjoyment of its members and their guests. 

( c) To operate as a non-profit organization which does not contemplate pecuniary gain 
or profit sharing by its members. 

Section 3. Location The principle office of the Club shall be located at 649 Golf Course 
Road, Jerome, Idaho, County of Jerome, Idaho. 
 



ARTICLE II 
MEMBERSHIP 

Section 1. Membership Categories:    The club shall have two membership categories 
designated as follows: Regular and Business. Eligibility is nondiscriminatory, i.e., no 
membership will be denied due to sex, race, creed, religion, national origin, or station in 
life. 

(a) Regular Members:   A person of good character, 18 or more years of age, shall be 
eligible for regular membership. 

(b) Business Memberships:   Business concerns may purchase memberships and 
designate an employee to utilize the membership as a regular member, subject to the 
approval of the Board. 

Section 2. Family Privileges:   Any person who is a legal member of the immediate 
family of a member of the club and actually dependent for his livelihood upon the family, 
enrolled in an institution of higher learning, or enlisted in the military shall be entitled to 
the same privileges and use of facilities as the member. The term "immediate family" 
shall mean the husband or wife of a regular member or both partners of a couple living 
together as though married and natural, adopted, or step-children of either, subject to 
other limitations. When no longer a dependent, enrolled in a higher learning institution, 
or enlisted in the military, that person's privileges in the club shall cease. In no event 
may a person described above, other than husband and wife, be allowed family 
privileges beyond his 24th birthday. 

Section 3. Certificates of Stock: Certificates of stock representing membership in and 
an equity ownership of the corporation shall be in such form as determined by the 
Board. Such certificates shall be signed by the President and the Secretary. All 
certificates for stock shall be consecutively numbered or otherwise identified. The name 
and address of the member and date of issue shall be entered on the membership 
books of the corporation. In case of a lost, destroyed, or mutilated certificate, a new one 
may be issued upon such terms and indemnity to the corporation as the Board may 
prescribe. 

Section 4. Membersbip Obligations: By accepting membership, the member shall 
agree to be bound by the Club's Article of Incorporation, Bylaws, Policies/Rules of 2017. 
 
































